
From: Ortiz, Deborah
To: Cathy Hoffman; R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk; Hank Baron
Subject: RE: FIFRA-04-2023-0707 b - Performance PC"s - Check Payment in Mail
Date: Friday, June 23, 2023 9:15:05 AM

Thanks! Email received.
 

From: Cathy Hoffman <accounting@performance-pcs.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2023 3:17 PM
To: R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk <R4_Regional_Hearing_Clerk@epa.gov>; Ortiz, Deborah
<ortiz.deborah@epa.gov>; Hank Baron <hank.baron@performance-pcs.com>
Subject: FIFRA-04-2023-0707 b - Performance PC's - Check Payment in Mail
 

Good Afternoon,

We are mailing the check payment of $35,900 via USPS Priority mail. Filing date
5/24/2023. Due date 6/23/2023.

Please find the attached scan as per instructed on fine.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Cathy Hoffman
 

Accounting
1701 Robert J. Conlan Blvd. NE, Unit #5
Palm Bay, FL 32905, USA
--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Toll Free: 888-381-8222 | Phone: 321-725-9969 (ext:106) | Fax: 549-5001
--------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
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